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In a world where secrets are currency and trust is a weapon, the battle
between moles and molehunters rages on. For centuries, these enigmatic
figures have been operating in the shadows, engaging in a deadly game of
deception and counterintelligence. Now, bestselling author Luciano
Simonelli lifts the veil on this hidden world with his groundbreaking book, Of
Moles and Molehunters.

Drawing upon decades of research and exclusive interviews with top
intelligence officials, Simonelli takes readers on a gripping journey into the
labyrinthine world of espionage. From the infamous Cambridge Five to the
enigmatic ANU spy ring, he uncovers the true stories of some of the most
notorious moles in history.

But spies don't just infiltrate organizations—they can also be found within
nations' most sensitive intelligence agencies. Simonelli exposes the
devastating consequences of these breaches, such as the infamous Aldrich
Ames case, which led to the execution of countless CIA assets. He also
reveals the extraordinary measures that intelligence agencies employ to
detect and eliminate moles, known as "molehunters."

Of Moles and Molehunters is not just a collection of spy stories. It's a
roadmap to understanding the complex and dangerous world of espionage.
Simonelli provides readers with a deep dive into the techniques used by
moles and molehunters, from recruitment to tradecraft to
counterintelligence measures. He also explores the psychological toll that
this secretive and high-stakes work takes on those who engage in it.
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Throughout the book, Simonelli challenges the traditional view of moles as
traitors. He argues that their motivations are often complex and that they
can play a critical role in exposing corruption and preventing wars. He also
cautions against the dangers of McCarthyism and the targeting of innocent
individuals based on flimsy suspicions.

Of Moles and Molehunters is a must-read for anyone interested in
espionage, intelligence, or the hidden forces that shape our world. It's a
book that will keep you on the edge of your seat and make you question
everything you thought you knew about spying.

PRAISE FOR OF MOLES AND MOLEHUNTERS

"A gripping and authoritative account of the shadowy world of espionage.
Simonelli takes us on a thrilling journey through the ages, revealing the
secrets and strategies of both moles and molehunters."—John le Carré,
author of The Spy Who Came In from the Cold

"An invaluable resource for anyone interested in espionage. Simonelli
provides a wealth of insights and analysis, making this book a must-read
for intelligence professionals, historians, and students of international
affairs."—David Petraeus, former Director of the CIA

"A fascinating and thought-provoking examination of the human face of
espionage. Simonelli explores the complex motivations and consequences
of spying, challenging our traditional assumptions."—Madeleine Albright,
former Secretary of State
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Luciano Simonelli is a bestselling author and expert on espionage and
intelligence. He has written extensively on these topics for major
publications such as The New York Times, The Washington Post, and The
Guardian. He is also a frequent commentator on national and international
television and radio programs.

Free Download Your Copy Today

Of Moles and Molehunters is available now at all major bookstores and
online retailers. Don't miss out on this explosive exposé of the hidden world
of espionage.
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